
BID ABSTRACT - IFB 34549 - Station Uniforms - Aircraft Rescue and Firefighting (ARFF)

Notes

Item Description RIAC Units needed Equivalent* Unit Cost Equivalent* Unit Cost Equivalent* Unit Cost Equivalent* Unit Cost

1 Long Sleeve Duty Uniform Shirt - Elbeco 314N, Color: White
see attachment see attachment 49.06$                             55.00$                      

 Fechheimer 

33W78Z 57.00$                 

2 Uniform Trouser - Elbeco E314RN 4-Pocket Trouser
see attachment see attachment 40.71 63.00

 Fechheimer 

85R78Z ($48) 0.0

Incorrect bid *Galls equivalent is a 

shirt, not trouser

3 Short Sleeve Duty Uniform Shirt - Elbeco 3314N, Color: White
see attachment see attachment 43.93 50.00 45.00$                 

4 UFX Short Sleeve Tactical Polo- Elbeco K5134, Color: White, Navy, Red
see attachment see attachment 59.87 61.00

Propper 

F5341726 43.68

193.57$                           229.00$                    145.68$               

RIAC Units needed
Notes

Item Description Equivalent* Unit Cost Equivalent* Unit Cost Equivalent* Unit Cost Equivalent* Unit Cost

1 Short Sleeve Station Shirts-Flying Cross 7000, 100% Cotton, Color: Light Blue
see attachment see attachment 64.54

 $75.00 (Sub First 

Tactical 112008) Lion 0227MB 72.83$                 

*Galls - Long sleeve, not short 

sleeve (67.45) swapped

2 Long Sleeve Station Shirts-Flying Cross 7020, 100% Cotton, Color: Light Blue
see attachment see attachment 68.41

 $78.00 (Sub First 

Tactical 111009) Lion 0527MB 67.45

*Galls - Short sleeve, not long 

sleeve (72.83) swapped

132.95$                           153.00$                    140.28$               

RIAC Units needed
Notes

Item Description Equivalent* Unit Cost Equivalent* Unit Cost Equivalent* Unit Cost Equivalent* Unit Cost

1 5.11 Tactical 1/4 zip Job Shirt #72314 Color: Fire Navy
see attachment see attachment 86.35$                             92.50$                      67.72

2 5.11 Tactical Proffesional Polo Shirt, Short Sleeve #41060
see attachment see attachment 61.71 66.50 39.00

3 5.11 Tactical Proffesional Polo Shirt, Long Sleeve #42056
see attachment see attachment 65.53 68.00 42.86

4 5.11 Tactical Pant Model #74251 Color: Fire Navy
see attachment see attachment 50.96 70.00 47.03

5 5.11 Tactical Company Pant 2.0 #74508 Color: Fire Navy
see attachment see attachment 62.06 80.00 61.66

6 5.11 Tactical Short #73285 Color: Fire Navy
see attachment see attachment 43.31 61.00 42.86

7 5.11 Tactical Responder Hi Vis Parka #48073 Color:Red
see attachment see attachment 249.01

250.00 (Sub Game 

3555) 290.00

618.93$                           688.00$                    591.13$               

RIAC Units needed
Notes

Item Description Equivalent* Unit Cost Equivalent* Unit Cost Equivalent* Unit Cost Equivalent* Unit Cost

1
Smith & Warren Badges #S155SQ Rhodium Electroplate, Firefighter, 

Lieutenant, Captain see attachment see attachment 75 86.00$                      84.91$                 

2 Smith & Warren Badges #S155SQ Gold Electroplate, Deputy Chief and Chief
see attachment see attachment 78.52 100.00 88.91

3
Eiseman-Ludmar Co. Inc. Insignais M/2182-S, Silver Insignia with Red Disk- 

With Rank Insignia -Firefighter, Lieutenant, Captain see attachment see attachment 11.95 10.00 35.82

4
Eiseman-Ludmar Co. Inc. Insignais M/2182-G, Gold Insignia with Red Disk- 

With Rank Insignia -Deputy Chief, Chief. see attachment see attachment 11.95 11.95 36.91

5 Department Patch - Department Shoulder Patch
see attachment see attachment 4.30

3.00 (Minimum Qty 

100) 0 (included)

181.72 210.95$                    246.55

RIAC Units needed
Notes

Item Description Equivalent* Unit Cost Equivalent* Unit Cost Equivalent* Unit Cost Equivalent* Unit Cost

1
6 Inch. Side Zip, Waterproof, Bloodbourne Pathogen Resistant, ASTM F2413-

11M 1/75/C75 Composite Safety Toe Rating. Color: Black see attachment see attachment No Bid $125.00 (RB 8674) 163.08$               

2
8 Inch. Side Zip, Waterproof, Bloodbourne Pathogen Resistant, ASTM F2413-

11M 1/75/C75 Composite Safety Toe Rating. Color: Black see attachment see attachment No Bid 135.00 (RB 8874) 110.00

3
10 Inch. Side Zip, Waterproof, Bloodbourne Pathogen Resistant, ASTM F2413-

11M 1/75/C75 Composite Safety Toe Rating. Color: Black see attachment see attachment No Bid No Bid 78.46

4
Low Cut Boot, ASTM F2413-11M 1/75/C75 Composite Safety Toe Rating.

Color: Black see attachment see attachment No Bid 115.00 (RB 8405) No Bid

5
Station Shoe, ASTM F2413-11M 1/75/C75 Composite Safety Toe Rating.

Color: Black see attachment see attachment 114.30 105.00 (RB 8105) No Bid

114.30$                           480.00$                    351.54$               

* Please check off if bidding equivalent product.  Product(s) should be listed in Bid Reponse Form Item No. 9 explaining deviation with full description and

   Bid Response to include a sample of the product, labeled with corresponding Item Number  and detailed specification sheet.

SECTION A - UNIFORMS- Chief Officers

SECTION A - TOTAL BID

SECTION F - TOTAL BID

SECTION B - UNIFORMS-Firefighters, Lieutenants & Captains

SECTION B - TOTAL BID

SECTION C - UNIFORMS-Firefighters, Lieutenants, Captains & Chiefs

SECTION C - TOTAL BID

SECTION E - Footwear

SECTION D - Badges and Insignias-Firefighters, Lieutenants, Captains & 

Chiefs

SECTION E - TOTAL BID

American Fire Gear, LLC Municipal Emergency Stillman Uniforms Galls, LLC

American Fire Gear, LLC Municipal Emergency Stillman Uniforms Galls, LLC

American Fire Gear, LLC Municipal Emergency Stillman Uniforms Galls, LLC

American Fire Gear, LLC Municipal Emergency Stillman Uniforms Galls, LLC

American Fire Gear, LLC Municipal Emergency Stillman Uniforms Galls, LLC










